
Attachment 1

SUBMITTER Brand/Model
Cost per 

copy
Two-year 

Annual Cost
Cost per 

copy
Three-year 

Annual Cost

*1. Cell Business Equipment (CBE) Sharp Electronics 0.0189 17,482.50$     0.0149 13,782.50$     
DBA SEMA Inc AR-M62OU
4A Mason St Overage cost/copy 0.0060 0.0060
Irvine, CA  92618

2. BMC Inc Hewlett Packard 0.0192 17,760.00$     0.0182 16,835.00$     
6735 Odessa Ave 9065 MFP
Lake Balboa, CA  91406-5747 Overage cost/copy 0.0085 0.0085

3. California Office Systems Kyocera Mita 0.0212 19,610.00$     0.0168 15,540.00$     
1675 Scenic Ave KM6330 ** 18,629.50       ** 14,763.00       

Costa Mesa, CA  92626 Overage cost/copy 0.0060 0.0060

4. Image IV Konica Minolta 0.0206 19,055.00$     0.0165 15,262.50$     
512 South Varney St. 7272
Burbank, CA  91502 Overage cost/copy 0.0065 0.0065

5. Contact Office Solutions Ricoh 0.0220 20,350.00$     0.0165 15,262.50$     
17767 Mitchell North AF-2060SP
Irvine, CA  92614 Overage cost/copy 0.0070 0.0070

6. Xerox Corporation Xerox - option 1 0.02518 23,292.43$     0.02032 18,797.74$     
Western Education & Gov Oper. Doc Centre 470
1851 E First St Suite# 260 Overage cost/copy 0.0079 0.0079
Santa Ana, CA  92705 Xerox - option 2 0.0338317 31,294.34$    0.0270033 24,978.02$    

CopyCentre 65
Overage cost/copy 0.0089 0.0089

Xerox - option 3 0.0332604 30,765.86$     0.0265923 24,597.86$     
CopyCentre 165
Overage cost/copy 0.0089 0.0089

7. FKM/Toshiba Toshiba
5 Studebaker E-Studio 600
Irvine, CA  92618

8. Canon Business Solutions
123 Paularino Ave
Costa Mesa, CA  92626

9. Imagistics
25351 Commercecentre #100
Irvine, CA  92604

Overage cost/copy

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Two-Year Contract Three-Year Contract

*Non-responsive *Non-responsive
*Specs not met *Specs not met

ATTACHMENT  I
FORMAL BID TABULATION -  BID ITEM NO.  1084

TWO COPIERS FOR TWO OR THREE YEAR CONTRACT
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