Attachment 2

DATE: 10/11/2006 CITY OF COSTA MESA REF. #920
BID TABULATION

VENDOR Power Honda Norm Reeves Honda Honda Santa Ana Honda World Fla
PHONE 714/436-5050 714/842-5431 714/547-3555 714/890-8900 9
FAX 714/436-2414 714/842-8502 714/667-5182 714/895-8563 9z
ADDRESS XXX XXX XXX XXX
CITY/STATE Costa Mesa XXX XXX XXX
ATTENTION XXX XXX XXX XXX
VENDOR # XXX XXX XXX XXX
ITEM QTY. | UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PR
2006 or 2007 Honda Accord 1 $22,640.00 22,640.00 | $21,838.00 21,838.00 no bid no bid} no bid no bid n
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
SUBTOTAL 22,640.00 21,838.00 0.00 0.00
TAX 0.0775 1,754.60 1,695.93 0.00 0.00 |
DOC FEE 0.00 45.00 0.00 0.00
TIRE FEES $8.75 $5.00 |
TOTAL Dest. $24,403.35 Dest. $23,583.93 Dest. Dest. Dest
5% Preference ($1,132.00) $0.00
GRAND TOTAL $23,271.35 $23,583.93 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bit




